



(IFB 20-008/KJS), Term Contract for Herbicides

FINAL TABULATION September 8, 2020

SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 E. 36th Street Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Attn: John Morgan jmorgan@siteone.com Phone: 281-520-8580	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC 41232-B Park 290 Waller, Texas Attn: Kelly Duffie duffiek@helenaagri.com Phone: 281-415-7301	Red River Specialties LLC 1324 North Hearne Ave. Ste., 120 Shreveport, LA 71107 Attn: Chad Chambliss chad.chambliss@rrsi.com Phone: 318-425-5944	Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc 140 Arkansas St Monticello, AR 71655 Attn: Tim Roark timothy.roark@nutrien.com Phone: 337-200-1407	DBA Target Specialty Products 11730 Airline Hwy Baton Rouge, LA 70817 Attn: Patrick Sutton patrick.sutton@target-specialty.com Phone: 318-254-3330
---	---	---	---	---

Term Contract for Herbicides																
Line #	Description	Unit	Mfgr.	Price Per Unit	Unit	Mfgr.	Price Per Unit	Unit	Mfgr.	Price Per Unit	Unit	Mfgr.	Price Per Unit	Unit	Mfgr.	Price Per Unit
1	CLEARCAST or equivalent	1-GAL	SePro	\$ 498.12	1-GAL	SePro	\$ 282.07	1-GAL	SePro	\$ 282.07	1-GAL	SePro	\$ 282.07	1-GAL	SePro	\$ 282.07
		15- GAL	SePro	No Bid	15- GAL	SePro	\$ 281.32	15- GAL	SePro	\$ 281.32	15- GAL	SePro	\$ 281.32	15- GAL	SePro	\$ 281.32
2	MILESTONE or equivalent	2.5-GAL	Dow	\$ 441.71	2.5-GAL	Corteva	\$ 300.00	2.5-GAL	Corteva	\$ 300.00	2.5-GAL	Corteva	\$ 300.00	2.5-GAL	Corteva	\$ 300.00
3	MSM 60DF or equivalent	8-OZ	Quali-Pro	\$ 5.84	8-OZ	Helena Agri	\$ 4.50	8-OZ	Bayer	\$ 2.65	8-OZ	Bayer	\$ 3.15	8-OZ	Alligare	\$ 2.71
		48-OZ	Quali-Pro	\$ 5.84	48-OZ	Helena Agri	\$ 4.50	64-OZ	Bayer	\$ 2.55	48-OZ	Bayer	\$ 3.15	48-OZ	Alligare	No Bid
4	POLARIS or equivalent	2.5-GAL	Nufarm	\$ 79.06	2.5-GAL	Nufarm	\$ 52.40	2.5-GAL	BASF	\$ 52.85	2.5-GAL	Nufarm	\$ 52.00	2.5-GAL	Alligare	\$ 60.44
5	RANGER PRO or equivalent	2.5-GAL	Monsanto	\$ 39.22	2.5-GAL	Bayer	\$ 13.20	2.5-GAL	Ragan & Massey	\$ 11.95	2.5-GAL	Monsanto	\$ 11.75	2.5-GAL	Bayer	\$ 12.80
		30-GAL	Monsanto	No Bid	30-GAL	Bayer	\$ 13.00	30-GAL	Ragan & Massey	\$ 11.42	30-GAL	Monsanto	\$ 11.75	30-GAL	Bayer	\$ 12.25
6	ROUNDUP CUSTOM or equivalent	2.5-GAL	Monsanto	\$ 23.81	2.5-GAL	Bayer	\$ 17.30	2.5-GAL	Bayer	\$ 17.97	2.5-GAL	Monsanto	\$ 16.80	2.5-GAL	Bayer	\$ 19.20
		30-GAL	Monsanto	No Bid	30-GAL	Bayer	\$ 17.30	30-GAL	Bayer	\$ 17.76	30-GAL	Monsanto	\$ 16.80	30-GAL	Bayer	\$ 19.00
7	TRYCERA or equivalent	2.5-GAL		No Bid	2.5-GAL	Helena Agri	\$ 81.80	2.5-GAL	Corteva	\$ 39.98	2.5-GAL	Helena	\$ 85.00	2.5-GAL	Albaugh	\$ 60.30
		250-GAL		No Bid	250-GAL	Helena Agri	\$ 80.90	250-GAL	Corteva	No Bid	250-GAL	Helena	\$ 85.00	250-GAL	Albaugh	No Bid
8	ACCURACY or equivalent	1-QT		No Bid	1-QT	Helena Agri	\$ 10.30	1-QT	Red River Specialties LLC.	\$ 9.21	1-QT	LPI	\$ 11.00	1-QT	SanAg	\$ 15.72
		1-GAL		No Bid	1-GAL	Helena Agri	\$ 35.80	1-GAL	Red River Specialties LLC.	\$ 28.95	1-GAL	LPI	No Bid	1-GAL	SanAg	No Bid
9	FOAMBUSTER or equivalent	1-PT	Aquafix, Inc.	\$ 10.25	1-PT	Helena Agri	\$ 8.70	1-QT	Red River Specialties LLC.	\$ 8.96	1-PT	LPI	No Bid	1-QT	Prime Source	\$ 9.20
		1-GAL	Aquafix, Inc.	\$ 82.00	1-GAL	Helena Agri	\$ 29.20	1-GAL	Red River Specialties LLC.	\$ 20.89	1-GAL	LPI	\$ 27.00	1-GAL	Prime Source	\$ 26.50
10	DLZ or equivalent	2.5-GAL	LESCO	\$ 38.62	2.5-GAL	Helena Agri	\$ 31.20	2.5-GAL	Red River Specialties LLC.	\$ 23.48	2.5-GAL	LPI	\$ 27.00	2.5-GAL	Turf Fuel	\$ 34.17
11	DYNE-AMID or equivalent	2.5-GAL	Brandt	\$ 39.63	2.5-GAL	Helena Agri	\$ 38.60	2.5-GAL	Red River Specialties LLC.	\$ 25.98	2.5-GAL	LPI	\$ 12.00	2.5-GAL	Turf Fuel	\$ 31.30
12	SURFACTANT for Aquatic Sites	2.5-GAL	LESCO	\$ 37.19	2.5-GAL	Helena Agri	\$ 23.90	2.5-GAL	Red River Specialties LLC.	\$ 9.58	2.5-GAL	LPI	\$ 12.60	1-GAL	Brandt	\$ 14.95